
FREE LEISTER® TRIAC AT HEAT GUN KIT WHEN YOU BUY 5 ROLLS OF ARDEX
WPM 750 OR ARDEX WPM 1000 MEMBRANES - TERMS & CONDITIONS

Purchase five (5) rolls of ARDEX WPM 750 and/or ARDEX WPM
1000. Multiple entries can be made over the promotional
period. 
Complete the registration form online and upload your receipt
online to verify your purchase. 

Copies of invoices will be requested to claim a Leister gun and
please note we may contact your distributor to confirm the
purchase
Invoices must be dated 1 September 2022 to 28 February 2023

1. Entry is open to customers who purchase five (5) rolls of ARDEX
WPM 750 and/or ARDEX WPM 1000 from participating stores or
direct from ARDEX New Zealand. Employees and immediate
families of the ‘Promoter’ and ‘Promotional Partners’ are ineligible
to enter. Persons must be over the age of 18 to enter. 

2. The Promoter reserves the right to verify the validity of
entries/claims and to disqualify any entrant who tampers with the
entry/claims process or who submits an entry/ claim that is not in
accordance with these Conditions of Entry. 

3. The Promotion commences on 1 September 2022. The final date
for entries/registration is  28 February 2023. No responsibility
accepted for late, lost or misdirected entries. 

4. Each installer company is eligible to a limit of five (5) guns during
the promotion period or at the promotors discretion. 

5. How to Enter: 

6. Applies to non-discounted sales only of WPM750 (13319) or
WPM 1000 (16475) to eligible customers, these are waterproofing
customers or installers (reseller customers) purchasing through
any reseller. 

7. Offer only applies to full price purchases of WPM750 (13319) or
WPM 1000 (16475), not purchases that have special project pricing,
price discounts or special pricing of any form.

8. Products are specifically 13319 and 16475 not special sized
products, made to order products or other ARDEX membrane
products

9. Must be a single purchase of 5 rolls on one invoice

10. Guns may be delivered in individual deliveries depending on
stock availability. Delivery of guns to be completed by 30 April
2023. 

11. Promoters’ decision is final, and no correspondence will be
entered into. 

12. Any costs in excess of the value of the Prizes (if applicable),
including GST, and all ancillary costs associated with redeeming the
prizes are the responsibility of the winner. 

13. The LEISTER® Triac AT Heat Gun Kit is not exchangeable, not
transferable and cannot be taken as cash. If the prize is
unavailable, the Promoter, in its discretion, reserves the right to
substitute the prize with a prize to the equal value and/ or
specification, subject to any written directions from a regulatory
authority. 

16. The Promoter shall not be liable for any loss or damage
whatsoever which is suffered (including but not limited to indirect
or consequential loss) or for personal injury which is suffered or

sustained, as a result of taking any of the prizes, except for any
liability which cannot be excluded by law. 

16. The Promoter is not responsible for any incorrect or inaccurate
information, either caused by website users or by any of the
equipment or programming associated with or utilised in this
competition, or by any technical error that may occur in the course
of the administration of this competition. The Promoter assumes
no responsibility for any error, omission, interruption, deletion,
defect, delay in operation or transmission, communications line
failure, theft or destruction or unauthorised access to or alteration
of entries. Any contact details entered incorrectly shall be deemed
invalid. 

17. As a condition of accepting a prize, the winner must sign any
legal documentation as in the form required by the Promoter
and/or prize suppliers in their absolute discretion, including but not
limited to a legal release and indemnity form. 

18. Entrants can only enter in their own name. Entrants who
provide incorrect, misleading or fraudulent information are
ineligible to participate in the Promotion and all entries of an
Entrant who is deemed by the Promoter to have provided
incorrect, misleading or fraudulent information may, at the
discretion of the Promoter, be deemed invalid. The Promoter
reserves the right to request the Entrant produce (within the
requested time) appropriate photo identification or other
documentation (to The Promoter’s satisfaction, at its sole
discretion) in order to confirm the Entrant’s identity, age, residential
address, eligibility to enter and claim the Prize, and any information
submitted by the Entrant in entering the Promotion, before issuing
the Prize. If the documentation required by The Promoter is not
received by The Promoter (or its nominated agent) or an Entrant or
entry has not been verified or validated to The Promoter’s
satisfaction then all the entries of that Entrant will be ineligible and
deemed invalid. 

20. The Promoter collects personal information in order to conduct
the Promotion and may, for this purpose, disclose such
information to third parties, including but not limited to agents,
contractors, prize suppliers and, as required, to New Zealand
regulatory authorities. Entry is conditional on providing this
information. If the entrant ‘opts in’, the Promoter may, for an
indefinite period, use the information for promotional, marketing,
publicity, research and profiling purposes, including sending
electronic messages or telephoning the entrant. Entrants should
direct any request to access, update or correct information to the
Promoter. All entries become the property of the Promoter. 

21. If this Promotion is not capable of running as planned for any
reason, including but not limited to war, terrorism, state of
emergency or disaster (including natural disaster), infection by
computer virus, bugs, tampering, unauthorised intervention,
technical failures or anything which corrupts or affects the
administration, security, fairness, integrity or proper conduct of this
Promotion, The Promoter reserves the right, in its sole discretion,
to cancel, terminate, modify or suspend the Promotion, subject to
regulatory approval. 

22. The ‘Promoter’ is Ardex New Zealand, 15 Alfred Street,
Onehunga, Auckland, 1061


